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email: "G2georgiapps@southernco.com"
Friday, June 1, 2018 at 10:06:59 AM Pacific Daylight Time

To: email: "chair@sailga.org"
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Bill Payment Reminder
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This is a reminder that your paperless bill for Georgia Power is available for viewing and payment. To view your bill and pay on-line click here..
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You may now elect to turn off the reminder or change when you wish to receive it. Billing Preferences
Account Number:
01000-89012

Total Amount Billed: $146.88

Due Date:
June 8, 2018

If you are unable to view your paperless bill using the link above, please copy and paste this URL into your web browser:

https://customerservice2. southerncompany.com/Login? mnuOpco=GPC&cid=email_transaction_bill-pay-

 HYPERLINK "https://customerservice2.southerncompany.com/Login?mnuOpco=GPC&cid=email_transaction_bill-pay-reminder_GPC" reminder_GPC
This eMail box is not monitored. Please do not reply to this message. If you would like to contact Georgia Power Company's customer service, please see the
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contact information below.
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Georgia Power Company Customer Service

Visit us at www.georgiapower.com (When contacting us by e-mail, please include your name, bill account number, e-mail address, and reason for your inquiry).

Sincerely,

Georgia Power's Online Customer Care Team
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email: "chair@sailga.org Kristy Zgol"



Sunday, June 3, 2018 at 3:16:10 PM Pacific Daylight Time

To: email: "cherylsalter@sailga.org Cheryl Salter"

---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: <G2georgiapps@southernco.com>

Date: Fri, Jun 1, 2018 at 1:06 PM

Subject: Georgia Power Bill Payment Reminder

To: chair@sailga.org
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Bill Payment Reminder
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This is a reminder that your paperless bill for Georgia Power is available for viewing and payment. To view your bill and pay on-line click here..

You may now elect to turn off the reminder or change when you wish to receive it. Billing Preferences
Account Number:
01000-89012

Total Amount Billed: $146.88

Due Date:
June 8, 2018

If you are unable to view your paperless bill using the link above, please copy and paste this URL into your web browser:

https://customerservice2. southerncompany.com/Login? mnuOpco=GPC&cid=email_transaction_bill-pay-

 HYPERLINK "https://customerservice2.southerncompany.com/Login?mnuOpco=GPC&cid=email_transaction_bill-pay-reminder_GPC" reminder_GPC
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This eMail box is not monitored. Please do not reply to this message. If you would like to contact Georgia Power Company's customer service, please see the contact information below.

Georgia Power Company Customer Service

Visit us at www.georgiapower.com (When contacting us by e-mail, please include your name, bill account number, e-mail address, and reason for your inquiry).

Sincerely,

Georgia Power's Online Customer Care Team
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Georgia Power Marketplace
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--

All the best,

Kristy Zgol

Superintendent

SAIL: School for Arts-Infused Learning

4575 Blanchard Woods Drive

Evans, GA 30809
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email: "cherylsalter@sailga.org Cheryl Salter"
Monday, June 4, 2018 at 6:24:32 AM Pacific Daylight Time

To: email: "chair@sailga.org Kristy Zgol"

Good Morning Kristy,

Is this a new power pole for the new construction site? If so, shouldn't True North take care of the bill until construction is complete?

Cheryl J. Salter

Director of Business Operations

762-585-1125

cherylsalter@sailga.org
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On Sun, Jun 3, 2018 at 6:16 PM, Kristy Zgol <chair@sailga.org> wrote:
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---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: <G2georgiapps@southernco.com>

Date: Fri, Jun 1, 2018 at 1:06 PM

Subject: Georgia Power Bill Payment Reminder

To: chair@sailga.org
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Bill Payment Reminder
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[image: image2]This is a reminder that your paperless bill for Georgia Power is available for viewing and payment. To view your bill and pay on-line click here..
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You may now elect to turn off the reminder or change when you wish to receive it. Billing Preferences
Account Number:
01000-89012

Total Amount Billed: $146.88

Due Date:
June 8, 2018

If you are unable to view your paperless bill using the link above, please copy and paste this URL into your web browser:

https://customerservice2. southerncompany.com/Login? mnuOpco=GPC&cid=email_transaction_bill-pay-

 HYPERLINK "https://customerservice2.southerncompany.com/Login?mnuOpco=GPC&cid=email_transaction_bill-pay-reminder_GPC" reminder_GPC
This eMail box is not monitored. Please do not reply to this message. If you would like to contact Georgia Power Company's customer service, please see the contact information below.

Georgia Power Company Customer Service

Visit us at www.georgiapower.com (When contacting us by e-mail, please include your name, bill account number, e-mail address, and reason for your inquiry).

Sincerely,



Georgia Power Marketplace
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Budget Bill
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Georgia Power's Online Customer Care Team
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--

All the best,

Kristy Zgol

Superintendent

SAIL: School for Arts-Infused Learning

4575 Blanchard Woods Drive
Evans, GA 30809
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email: "chair@sailga.org Kristy Zgol"
Monday, June 4, 2018 at 2:04:48 PM Pacific Daylight Time

To: email: "cherylsalter@sailga.org Cheryl Salter"

Not sure, I cannot even see the bill.

On Mon, Jun 4, 2018 at 9:24 AM, Cheryl Salter <cherylsalter@sailga.org> wrote:

Good Morning Kristy,
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Is this a new power pole for the new construction site? If so, shouldn't True North take care of the bill until construction is complete?

Cheryl J. Salter

Director of Business Operations

762-585-1125

cherylsalter@sailga.org
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On Sun, Jun 3, 2018 at 6:16 PM, Kristy Zgol <chair@sailga.org> wrote:
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---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: <G2georgiapps@southernco.com>

Date: Fri, Jun 1, 2018 at 1:06 PM

Subject: Georgia Power Bill Payment Reminder

To: chair@sailga.org
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Bill Payment Reminder
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[image: image3]This is a reminder that your paperless bill for Georgia Power is available for viewing and payment. To view your bill and pay on-line click here..
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You may now elect to turn off the reminder or change when you wish to receive it. Billing Preferences
Account Number:
01000-89012

Total Amount Billed: $146.88

Due Date:
June 8, 2018

If you are unable to view your paperless bill using the
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link above, please copy and paste this URL into your
	Budget Bill

	web browser:
	

	https://customerservice2.
	

	southerncompany.com/Login?
	
	
	
	
	

	mnuOpco=GPC&cid=email_
	transaction_bill-pay-
	

	reminder_GPC
	
	
	

	This eMail box is not monitored. Please do not reply to
	

	this message. If you would like to contact Georgia
	

	
	

	Power Company's customer service, please see the
	

	contact information below.
	

	Georgia Power Company Customer Service
	

	Visit us at www.georgiapower.com (When contacting
	

	
	
	name, bill account
	

	us by e-mail, please include your
	
	

	number, e-mail address, and reason for your inquiry).
	

	Sincerely,
	

	Georgia Power's Online Customer Care Team
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All the best,

Kristy Zgol

Superintendent

SAIL: School for Arts-Infused Learning

4575 Blanchard Woods Drive
Evans, GA 30809
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--

All the best,

Kristy Zgol

Superintendent

SAIL: School for Arts-Infused Learning

4575 Blanchard Woods Drive

Evans, GA 30809
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email: "cherylsalter@sailga.org Cheryl Salter"
Tuesday, June 5, 2018 at 11:36:48 AM Pacific Daylight Time

To: email: "chair@sailga.org Kristy Zgol"

Hi Kristy,

This is the bill for your personal residence.

Cheryl J. Salter

Director of Business Operations

762-585-1125

cherylsalter@sailga.org
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---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Cheryl Salter <cherylsalter@sailga.org>

Date: Tue, Jun 5, 2018 at 2:29 PM

Subject: Re: Georgia Power Bill Payment Reminder

To: Anita Russell <arussell@true-north-companies.com>

Thanks for the quick response!!!

Cheryl J. Salter

Director of Business Operations

762-585-1125

cherylsalter@sailga.org
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On Tue, Jun 5, 2018 at 2:20 PM, Anita Russell <arussell@true-north-companies.com> wrote:
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We have not requested any power meters at your location yet.

Sorry I couldn’t help.

Anita

From: Cheryl Salter <cherylsalter@sailga.org>

Sent: Tuesday, June 05, 2018 2:08 PM

To: Anita Russell <arussell@true-north-companies.com>

Subject: Fwd: Georgia Power Bill Payment Reminder

Hello Anita,
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I'm not sure about this electric bill and neither is Kristy. Did True North add a pole for the new construction? If so, will this account be paid by True North until construction is complete? I didn't get a copy of the bill, and I can't

pull it up electronically without the Pin # located on the bill. Just let me know if I need to contact Georgia Power on this.

Thanks for your help with this!

Cheryl J. Salter
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Director of Business Operations

762-585-1125

cherylsalter@sailga.org
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---------- Forwarded message ----------
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From: <G2georgiapps@southernco.com>

Date: Fri, Jun 1, 2018 at 1:06 PM

Subject: Georgia Power Bill Payment Reminder

To: chair@sailga.org
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Bill Payment Reminder
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[image: image4]This is a reminder that your paperless bill for Georgia Power is available for viewing and payment. To view your bill and pay on-line click here..
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You may now elect to turn off the reminder or change when you wish to receive it. Billing Preferences
Account Number:
01000-89012

Total Amount Billed: $146.88

Due Date:
June 8, 2018

If you are unable to view your paperless bill using the link above, please copy and paste this URL into your web browser:

https://customerservice2. southerncompany.com/Login? mnuOpco=GPC&cid=email_transaction_bill-pay-

 HYPERLINK "https://customerservice2.southerncompany.com/Login?mnuOpco=GPC&cid=email_transaction_bill-pay-reminder_GPC" reminder_GPC
This eMail box is not monitored. Please do not reply to this message. If you would like to contact Georgia Power Company's customer service, please see the contact information below.

Georgia Power Company Customer Service



Georgia Power Marketplace
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Budget Bill
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Visit us at www.georgiapower.com (When contacting us by e-mail, please include your name, bill account number, e-mail address, and reason for your inquiry).
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Sincerely,

Georgia Power's Online Customer Care Team
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All the best,

[image: image74.png]A Georgia Power

B




Kristy Zgol

Superintendent

SAIL: School for Arts-Infused Learning

4575 Blanchard Woods Drive
Evans, GA 30809
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email: "chair@sailga.org Kristy Zgol"
Tuesday, June 5, 2018 at 3:36:03 PM Pacific Daylight Time

To: email: "cherylsalter@sailga.org Cheryl Salter"

And your point is...?

On Tue, Jun 5, 2018 at 2:36 PM Cheryl Salter <cherylsalter@sailga.org> wrote:

Hi Kristy,
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This is the bill for your personal residence.

Cheryl J. Salter

Director of Business Operations

762-585-1125

cherylsalter@sailga.org
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---------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Cheryl Salter <cherylsalter@sailga.org>

Date: Tue, Jun 5, 2018 at 2:29 PM

Subject: Re: Georgia Power Bill Payment Reminder

To: Anita Russell <arussell@true-north-companies.com>
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Thanks for the quick response!!!

Cheryl J. Salter

Director of Business Operations

762-585-1125

cherylsalter@sailga.org
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On Tue, Jun 5, 2018 at 2:20 PM, Anita Russell <arussell@true-north-companies.com> wrote:
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We have not requested any power meters at your location yet.

Sorry I couldn’t help.

Anita

From: Cheryl Salter <cherylsalter@sailga.org>

Sent: Tuesday, June 05, 2018 2:08 PM

To: Anita Russell <arussell@true-north-companies.com>

Subject: Fwd: Georgia Power Bill Payment Reminder
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Hello Anita,

I'm not sure about this electric bill and neither is Kristy. Did True North add a pole for the new construction? If so, will this account be paid by True North until construction is complete? I didn't get a copy of the bill, and I can't

pull it up electronically without the Pin # located on the bill. Just let me know if I need to contact Georgia Power on this.

Thanks for your help with this!
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Cheryl J. Salter

Director of Business Operations

762-585-1125

cherylsalter@sailga.org
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---------- Forwarded message ----------
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From: <G2georgiapps@southernco.com>

Date: Fri, Jun 1, 2018 at 1:06 PM

Subject: Georgia Power Bill Payment Reminder

To: chair@sailga.org
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Bill Payment Reminder
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[image: image5]This is a reminder that your paperless bill for Georgia Power is available for viewing and payment. To view your bill and pay on-line click here..
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You may now elect to turn off the reminder or change when you wish to receive it. Billing Preferences
Account Number:
01000-89012

Total Amount Billed: $146.88

Due Date:
June 8, 2018

If you are unable to view your paperless bill using the link above, please copy and paste this URL into your web browser:

https://customerservice2. southerncompany.com/Login? mnuOpco=GPC&cid=email_transaction_bill-pay-

 HYPERLINK "https://customerservice2.southerncompany.com/Login?mnuOpco=GPC&cid=email_transaction_bill-pay-reminder_GPC" reminder_GPC



Georgia Power Marketplace
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Budget Bill
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This eMail box is not monitored. Please do not reply to this message. If you would like to contact Georgia Power Company's customer service, please see the contact information below.
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Georgia Power Company Customer Service

Visit us at www.georgiapower.com (When contacting us by e-mail, please include your name, bill account number, e-mail address, and reason for your inquiry).

Sincerely,

Georgia Power's Online Customer Care Team
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All the best,
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Kristy Zgol

Superintendent

SAIL: School for Arts-Infused Learning

4575 Blanchard Woods Drive
Evans, GA 30809
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--

All the best,

Kristy Zgol

Superintendent

SAIL: School for Arts-Infused Learning

4575 Blanchard Woods Drive

Evans, GA 30809
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